
 
Overview of the Industry    
  

Information Systems (IS) is 
a bridge between business 
and technology. IS focuses 
on the computer systems 
within a company to ensure 
the organizational goals are 
accomplished. Information 
Technology (IT) can be 
divided into hardware, 
software, or the internet.  

According to the U.S. 
Bureau of Labor Statistics, 
opportunities for computer 
professionals (including 
network administrators, 
computer system analyst, 
support specialist, and 
database administrators) 
are expected to rise through 
2022. The field is growing 
due to an increase of 
businesses and individuals 
using technology, the 
demand of computer 

security, and increase of 
IT in healthcare.  

Professionals may work 
for market leaders (such 
as Microsoft or Google), 
small- to medium-sized 
companies, government 
agencies, healthcare, or 
consulting.  

Employers seek 
candidates with formal 
education, ability to stay 
current on new 
technologies, are flexible, 
possess problem-solving 
abilities and interpersonal 
skills.   

Specializations within 
Kogod students can study 
are information systems 
and technology, 
entrepreneurship, finance, 
and international 
business. 

Recruiting Cycle 
• • • 

Recruitment cycle for full-
time and internship 
opportunities is ongoing.  

 

KCCD Events 
• • • 

Consulting Day – September  

IT’s a Carnival – November  

On-Campus Recruiting  

Careerpalooza/Career-Con – 
(fall/spring) 

Job & Internship Fair  – 
(fall/spring) 

Kogod Network – April  

Startup Career Expo at GW  

 

Information System & 
Technology  

                  

 



  
 

 
Junior Functional Support 
Analyst  

Software Client Liaison  

Account Manager 

Junior Project Manager  

Consultant  

IT Attestation Associate  

Analytics Analyst  

Associate Engineer Analyst  

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 Student and Professional Organizations to join  

 
Student Organizations  Professional Organizations 
Undergraduate Business Association  Association of Information Technology 

Professionals     

Toastmasters  Association for Information Systems   

 Association for Computing Machinery   

 Information Systems Security Association  

 

 
 

 

Sample Internship Sites  
• • • 

KPMG 

NJI Media 

National Public Radio 

The Millennium Project 

MindPetal Software 
Solutions 

British Embassy  

TechAmerica  

Syncsort  
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Technology 

                  

 
Sample Full-Time Jobs of Kogod Graduates 

• • • 

 

 

 

http://kogoduba.wix.com/kogoduba
http://aisnet.org/?
https://www.acm.org/
https://www.issa.org/

